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Titel der Werbeaktion 

Firmenname 

Quick guide to our phyproof® Reference Substances Certificate of Analysis 

Report number:  
 
Every certificate has a unique report number. 
This number can also be found on our labels, 
so the corresponding certificate can easily be 
identified. This guarantees complete traceabil-
ity. 
 
Batch number: 
 
Please note: Our worldwide distribution 
partner Sigma-Aldrich / Millipore-Sigma uses 
8-digit batch numbers. You can download our 
CoA from their website 
(www.sigmaaldrich.com). Just visit the 
respective product page and enter the batch 
number under „Certificate of Analysis“ or 
„Documents“. 
 
Quantity: 
 
We give the exact initial weight to two decimal 
places on the inner label of the vial to enable 
the production of stock solutions. Only the 
nominal order quantity is indicated on the 
outer label and the certificate of analysis.  

Supplementary data / Spectra:  
 
Spectra (e.g. for IR, NMR, UV, MS) for all 
identification tests as stated on the CoA are 
provided upon request and with your order. 

LOQ: 
 
A value below the limit of quantification (LOQ) 
is indicated with a less than symbol (<). The 
result is considered to be zero with regard to 
the calculation of the absolute content 
(compare formula below). 

Absolute content: 
 
The absolute content is given on the certifica-
te when the reference substance is certified 
as a primary reference substance. If the 
reference substance is provided as a salt the 
counter ion is treated as an impurity and 
deducted from the absolute content  (compare 
formula below).  

Calculation of absolute content: 
 
The absolute content in this example is 
calculated as follows:  
(100 % - 0 % (water) - 0 % (residual solvents) 
- 7.65 % (inorganic impurities)) x 98.84 %  
(chromatographic purity)/ 100 = 91 %  
(absolute content is rounded and given with 
no decimal places). 

Manufacturing date / Expiry date: 
 
The date of the last analysis equals the 
manufacturing date. The given stability period 
starts from the month the CoA was issued. In 
this case this corresponds to an expiry date of 
April 2025. 

Webshop 

Prices, MSDS, exemplary CoA for download, FAQ and much more is 
available on our website. Order phyproof

®
 Reference Substances with 

just a few clicks. Please visit: 
 

https://phyproof.phytolab.com/en/   

https://phyproof.phytolab.com/en/

